CERTIFIED BID TABULATION

Clinton Parks Phase 1
Traceway Parks & Towne Park
City of Clinton

CCD Project No. 23043.10

September 10, 2024 at 2:00 PM

CANIZARO e CAWTHON ¥ DAVIS

Architecture « Planning - Interior Design

CLINTON

. . Addenda Cost ($)
Certificate of Bid
Company (1) Responsibility # |Bond 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
J.E. Stevens Construction Group, LLC 24536-MC X X $1,080,000.00 $1,088,000.00 $1,175,000.00 $609,000.00 $582,000.00 $1,230,000.00
Schedule (Calendar Days)
Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
210 120 120 90 90 180
Addenda Cost
Certificate of Bid )
Company (2) Responsibility # |Bond 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Flagstar Construction Company, Inc. 10817-MC X X $1,339,000.00 $1,106,000.00 $1,169,000.00 $654,000.00 $626,000.00 $1,429,000.00
Schedule (Calendar Days)
Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
540 180 180 180 180 240
Addend Cost
Certificate of Bid enda ost (%)
Company (3) Responsibility # |Bond 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Probity Contracting Group, LLC 20417-MC X X $1,198,000.00 $1,149,000.00 $1,204,000.00 $547,000.00 $558,000.00 $1,282,000.00

Schedule (Calendar Days)

Base Bid
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30
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. . Addenda Cost ($)
Certificate of Bid
Company (4) Responsibility # |Bond| 1 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Mid State Construction of MS LLC 19418-MC X X X $1,087,000.00 $1,038,000.00 $1,064,000.00 $573,000.00 $528,000.00 $1,408,000.00
Schedule (Calendar Days)
Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
150 60 30 30 30 90
Addend Cost
Certificate of Bid enda ost (3)
Company (5) Responsibility # |Bond| 1 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Tinnin Construction Company, LLC 2584-MC X | x| X $950,000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Schedule (Calendar Days)
Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
300 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Addend Cost
Certificate of Bid enca ),
Company (6) Responsibility # |Bond| 1 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Tru-Mac, LLC 25837-MC X X X $876,800.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Schedule (Calendar Days)
Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
240 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Addenda Cost
Certificate of Bid (%)
Company (7) Responsibility # |Bond| 1 2 Base Bid Alternate No. 1 Alternate No. 2 Alternate No. 3 Alternate No. 4 Alternate No. 5
Diversified Contracting Services 25741-MC X X X $1,161,000.00 $938,000.00 $1,001,000.00 $630,000.00 $598,000.00 $1,193,000.00
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This is to certify that the above is a true and accurate Tabulation of Bids received. Certified By: 9/10/2024

CANIZARO CAWTHON DAVIS



